From: Lynn Sprague [mailto:LSprague@haywoodnc.net]

Sent: Wednesday, May 27, 2015 4:50 PM

To: Robert Hawk; richprice@jacksonnc.org; Chuck Wooten

Cc: Debra Sloan

Subject: FW: TVAAF Contract Agreement & Documents for SMADS

FY! This is the status of the grant for the cattle facility Lynn

From: TVA Grants [mailto:grants@wnccommunities.org]

Sent: Wednesday, May 27, 2015 10:14 AM

To: Lynn Sprague

Subject: Re: TVAAF Contract Agreement & Documents for SMADS

Hello Lynn,

The TVAAF Committee approved the grant based on the location at SMADS. If the location changes this
changes the intent of the grant and approval will be needed by the TVAAF Committee to move forward with
the grant. I suggest we put the status "on hold" until location is determined by the end of June. Once the
location is set, if it is not SMADS, you will need to resubmit your plan for this grant addressing the location
change providing clear rationale.

Please call me if you have any questions.
i

Linda L. Lamp

TVA Ag & Forestry Fund .

c¢/o WNC Communities

594 Brevard Road a,
Asheville, NC 28806

Office: 828-252-4783

On Thu, May 21, 2015 at 5:54 PM, Lynn Sprague <LSprague@haywoodnc.net> wrote:
A presentation by the SMADS Committee was made to the Jackson County Commission on Tuesday at a workshop
session. The Commissioners would like to wait until a building engineering report, now underway, is finalized over the
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next couple of weeks before they take action. As the RC&D Council, | would like to accept the grant with the Drexel Plant
being the first priority, but if not there, the equipment could be place at different location in Jackson County. Rob Hawk
the CES director, along with the cattlemen offered to find another site. Therefore the contract could specify that the facility
be placed in Jackson County and as the proposal stated be operational by the end of September. Lynn

From: TVA Grants [mailto:grants@wnccommunities.org]

Sent: Thursday, May 21, 2015 3:27 PM

To: Lynn Sprague

Subject: Fwd: TVAAF Contract Agreement & Documents for SMADS

Hi Lynn,
Just checking in with you on the status of this possible grant.

All the best,

L

---------- Forwarded message ----------

From: TVA Grants <grants@wnccommunities.org>

Date: Thu, Apr 30,2015 at 3:33 PM

Subject: TVAAF Contract Agreement & Documents for SMADS
To: Lynn Sprague <lIsprague(@haywoodnc.net>

Hello Lynn,

Congratulations on being selected to receive TVA Ag & Forestry Funds of $22,500 for your project
titled, "Cattle Load-Out Equipment for SMADS"

AGREEMENT: Attached to this email is the TVA Ag & Forestry Fund Agreement. Please review the
information carefully, print out 2 copies, sign and mail with a completed W-9 to the address

below. Make sure the signatures on the agreement include the Director, Board Chair or Manager of
your office and the individual responsible for the project. Once the originals are received we will sign
and mail an original back to you for your file.

PAYMENT & REPORTING FORMS: Two forms are attached to this email, one is for payment and
the other is the financial report form to be used with your quarterly report narrative. Both forms reflect
the budget conveyed in the proposal. Please review the information on the financial report form to
make sure it is accurate. Be sure to update the matching and in-kind information as needed for the
quarterly reports.

If you are ready to receive payment, the TVAAF Pay or Reimburse Form should be completed,
signed and mailed in with the Agreement and W-9 to receive the first/initial payment of your grant.
This same form can also be used to request payments/reimbursements during the grant cycle.

Expenses against this grant can start May 15, 2015 and must end before or by June 1, 2016.
EQUIPMENT: You have an equipment grant, so you can request up to 95% of the funds for the

first/initial payment. Be sure to include a quote or appropriate documentation with the request. The
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quote will need to be replaced with the actual receipt/invoice to close out the file at the end of the
grant cycle.

NON PROFITS: Be sure to include the two completed certification documents Conflict of Interest and
No Overdue Tax Debts with the 2 signed agreements and W-9.

Please confirm you have received this information. If you have any questions contact me
at grants@wnccommunities.org or call 828-252-4783.

All the best,
Lt

Linda L. Lamp

TVA Ag & Forestry Fund
c/o WNC Communities
594 Brevard Road
Asheyville, NC 28806
Office: 828-252-4783

Pursuant to North Carolina General Statutes Chapter 132, Public Records, this electronic mail message and any attachments hereto, as well as any electronic mail
message(s) sent in response to it, may be considered public record and as such are subject to request and review by anyone at any time.

E-mail correspondence to and from this address may be subject to the North Carolina Public Records Law and may be disclosed to
third parties by an authorized county official.



